
My name is Ron Stutesman, owner of Property ID #’s 159801000, 604757000 & 159762000, all on NE 
52nd street, corner of 94th Ave. I am requesting my properties be re-zoned to R-22, back to the zoning it 
was when I purchased the property nearly 25 years ago. Adjoining property owners Jan and Jill Leckron’s 
request to be joined in this application for re-zoning of their property on NE 94th Ave (ID # 15980000) to 
R-22 as well. I have included their declaration. I have personally spoken with all neighbors on NE 52nd 
Street, cross street 94th Avenue and shared my desire to be re-zoned to R-22 as their properties are 
now zoned. They are also aware of my plans to develop 8 townhouses facing their properties as well as 
3 additional townhouses built on the remaining parcel of Leckron’s current property. Not only are they 
100% in favor, but all are also 100% against any type of commercial activities on the peaceful dead-end 
street of NE 52nd street that they live on. Our conceptual plan would replace 3 older mobile homes 
(1968, 1978 and 1982) and one small home built in 1960 with 11 new beautiful townhouses. All 
neighbors are in favor. For the following reasons I believe my (20.285.070) proposal is more consistent 
with applicable policies of the Vancouver strategic plan and comprehensive plan than the existing 
designation and a change in circumstances has occurred since the existing designation was established. 
The proposal is necessary to further the public interest based on present needs and conditions. (Ord. M-
3959 § 19, 07/19/2010; Ord. M-3643, 01/26/2004) After listening to the City of Vancouver council and 
that of Clark County as well as reading numerous “Columbian” articles, my conclusion is that there is 
much more of a need for housing then there is a need to provide jobs. Businesses are finding it hard to 
fill job positions now, but there remains a housing shortage. We may have once believed the East side of 
the Vancouver Mall would develop like the West side; however, such development did not occur. Recent 
development of 360 storage units directly across from NE 52nd Street, facing 94th Ave all but insured 
less traffic in the neighborhood. The East side of the mall was a quiet neighborhood before the storage 
units were built. Our proposal would offer much needed housing but would also offer many job 
opportunities developing and maintaining the HOA townhouses in the future. Positives for rezoning and 
developing as proposed. 1. Would offer new housing in a price range below current median home prices 
in the category with the largest shortage ($350K- $400K). 2. Would provide numerous jobs developing 
and maintaining the HOA townhouses in the future. 3. The City of Vancouver would be net gain over 
$42,000.00 annually above current tax revenues generated from current properties. 4. Would greatly 
enhance the neighborhood. Thank you Ron Stutesman 

Hi Bryan, here is an update with some new information. All the remaining commercial property to the 
north of Storage Works on NE 94th Ave recently was purchased by Kingdom Movement, a church / 
ministry organization. Kingdom Movement is shown on GIS as new property owners of property ID #’s 
1598170002 and ID # 159771000 which was Naydenov Gymnastics. I was told they also purchased the 
property between those two, ID # 159794000 but GIS has BOLOKHOVSKIY ANDREY P as new owner. My 
understanding is that all the acquired property listed above will be used for nothing other than usage for 
Kingdom Movement Church/ministry. A major concern and a main reason I wanted to be re-zoned was 
because of the new development of some 360 storage units (Storage Works) directly across from our 
properties on NE 94th Ave. This ensured minimal traffic from this location and affects surrounding 
properties. This alone was a major factor why we wanted to be re-zoned R-22. The large properties 
listed above were the backbone of any future commercial plans remaining in the area. Mine and 
Leckron’s properties are now the only commercially zoned property remaining on the West side of the 



Vancouver Mall. We now sit directly across from Storage Works on 94th Ave, while my properties also 
share a dead-end road with other residents zoned R-22. Especially now, any thought of developing 
anything commercially viable on our properties has vastly diminished. I believe the benefits of 
developing new housing far outweighs the loss of any potential jobs on our properties. 
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