
Page 1 of 2 
 

CAHC 2024 Workplan 
Culture, Arts & 
Heritage Plan 

Board 
Commitment 

Subcommittee 
Commitment 

Title with description of 
Commission’s role Related objective  

Committee/board 
meeting hours, 
not staff work 
time 

Committee 
meeting hours, 
not committee 
prep time 

Culture, Arts and Heritage 
Grant Program 

Serve as grant selection 
committee, monitor process 
and suggest improvements, 
outreach/build relationships 
with applicants 

1.3 Expand 
City-supported 
arts and 
cultural 
programs 

4 meetings 

3-5 
instructional 
workshops for 
applicants 

Public Art Program: Inventory, 
Maintenance, Budget 

Immediate - Guide program 
development and set 
priorities; Long-term – serve 
as review committee and/or 
delegate to Public Art 
Committee 

1.3 Expand 
City-supported 
arts and 
cultural 
programs 

2-3 meetings  

Cultural Event Partnership 
Program 

Immediate - Advise on 
program formation; Long-
term – serve as selection 
committee 

1.4 Promote 
infusion of CAH 
into daily lives 

2-3 meetings  

Library Interim Use  

Advise on use policy, outreach 
to determine community 
needs, other roles TBA as 
program develops 

3.4 Facilitate 
artists 
successfully 
securing 
available 
space 

Ongoing   
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Arts Hub Engagement 

Networking & public 
engagement to support 
concept development, e.g., 
open houses, tabling, 
presentations 

3.2 Expand 
space for 
making, 
teaching and 
display of art 

Ongoing  

Engage Community Leaders 

Hear updates from guest 
speakers at meetings, provide 
updates from groups you are 
a part of 

1.2 Engage and 
elevate 
community 
leaders in 
support of CAH 

Ongoing  

Vancouver Art and Music 
Festival 

Networking with 
artists/performers,  marketing 
to public, with additional 
opportunities to volunteer 
day(s) of 

1.3 Expand 
City-supported 
arts and 
cultural 
programs 

As needed 

3-5 
Performing 
Arts 
Subcommittee 
meetings 

Public Art in Developments 

Advise on integration of art 
into public infrastructure and 
private developments via 
Public Works and Economic 
Prosperity and Housing 
departments 

1.4 Promote 
infusion of CAH 
into daily lives 

As needed  

 

 


